
tooth brushing and professional cleaning every six
months. Twice-daily tooth brushing and flossing with flu-
oride toothpaste and fluoride rinses should begin when
these products can be used without substantial ingestion.
Oral fluoride supplementation should be based on local
water fluoridation (see Table 1).5-8

Dietary education and restriction of simple sugars are
necessary to prevent plaque build-up between brushings.
Prolonged periods of orthodontic appliance placement
often necessitate extra measures to remove trapped food
and plaque. Dental irrigation devices like the Waterpik®,
interdental cleaning appliances, floss holders, and thread-
ers with woven or waxed floss facilitate the cleaning
process. Proper flossing technique is particularly impor-
tant in the effective removal of plaque from tooth surfaces
and appliance/tooth interfaces. Automated toothbrushes
can efficiently remove plaque and trapped food particu-
lates from all surfaces. Xylitol-containing mints or gum
can be used between brushings to prevent tartar buildup.9

These tactics coupled with continued oral hygiene
education can overcome the lack of motivation and/or
opposition to oral care commonly seen in adolescents
and young children. Individualized care must be given to
children with special needs such as neurodevelopmental
disabilities, metabolic problems (e.g., diabetes), or med-
ication-induced xerostomia. These children often need
frequent dental consultation, special training, and/or
assistance to accomplish their routine oral care.10

There are estrogen receptor sites in more than 300
areas of the body, including the oral cavity. The rise in
the ovarian sex hormone levels of estrogen and proges-
terone during puberty and the subsequent phases of the
menstrual cycle, particularly ovulation, increase gingival
inflammation and exudates. The gingival inflammation
that occurs with ovulation, the time of a surge in estrogen
levels, improves after onset of menses. 

Progesterone and estrogen change the rate and pattern
of gingival collagen production, thereby reducing the
body’s ability to repair and maintain the gingiva. Addi-
tionally, elevated estrogen and progesterone levels
increase the number of oral anaerobic bacteria and have
an effect on the onset and progression of periodontitis by
decreasing the phagocytic capacity of polymorphonu-
clear leukocytes, while increasing release of the inflam-
matory mediator interleukin-1beta (IL-1b). Sex hor-
mones also increase vascular permeability and enhance
proteolytic enzyme interaction with interleukin-6 (IL-6),
another inflammatory mediator.11 Sex hormone effects
on the gingiva, which also occur during pregnancy or
oral contraceptive use, can be mitigated by reduction of
plaque volume and implementation of oral hygiene prac-
tices that maintain it.12

The Role of Fluoride. When ingested, fluoride
becomes incorporated into the dentin and enamel of the
teeth, strengthening its resistance to demineralization.
Fluoride is also secreted into the saliva where it serves a
bacteriostatic function. Topically applied fluorides in
toothpastes, mouth rinses, and professionally applied
therapies strengthen teeth and augment decay resistance.
Community water fluoridation can optimize the naturally
occurring fluoride content of water to a level of 0.7-1.2
parts fluoride per million parts of water. Although effec-
tive and inexpensive, water fluoridation is only available
in communities with a centralized water source. When
public water fluoridation is unavailable, fluoride tablets,
drops, or lozenges are available by prescription; the cor-
rect dosages are provided in Table 1.8
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Table 1

Oral fluoride supplement dosage schedule

Age Fluoride Level in Drinking Water (ppm)

< 0.3 ppm 0.3-0.6 ppm > 0.6 ppm

Birth-6 months None None None

6 months-3 years 0.25 mg/d None None

3-6 years 0.5 mg/d 0.25 mg/d None 

6-16 years 1.0 mg/d 0.5 mg/d None 

Adapted from: American Dental Association. Oral Topics A-Z: 
Facts about Fluoride. Available at: www.ada.org//public/topics/
fluoride/fluoride_article01.asp. Accessed Nov. 12, 2006. 


